

THE NATIONAL BUILDING
1 South Sixth Street
TERRE HAUTE, INDIANA 47807-3510
Telephone 812/232-2434 Facsimile 812/235-3685
www.bopplaw.com

3/21/22

Renewable + necessary
mjb

INVOICE
February 22, 2022

Michael Gableman
Special Counsel to the Wisconsin Assembly Committee on
Campaigns and Elections
P O Box 510766
New Berlin, WI 53151

In Reference To: Legal Representation of Special Counsel Mike Gableman in WEC v. Wisconsin
State Assembly

Professional Services

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/4/2022	CEM	Conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding research assignment	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	Phone conference with Michael Massie regarding research item	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	Conference with Mike Dean regarding notice of appeal rules	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	CM/ECF Letter to Judge Langford	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/4/2022	MM	Phone conference with Courtney E. Milbank regarding research	0.10 150.00/hr	15.00
	MM	E-mail James Bopp, Jr. regarding research assignment	0.10 150.00/hr	15.00
	JB	Review Mike Dean research regarding appeal	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	JB	Review letter to Judge for WEC	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
	JB	Conference with Courtney E. Milbank regarding research assignment	0.10 450.00/hr	45.00
	CEM	Phone conference with Michael Massie regarding research	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
1/5/2022	MM	Review emails from James Bopp, Jr. and attachments	0.80 150.00/hr	120.00
	MM	Review Wisconsin subpoena statuses	0.80 150.00/hr	120.00
	JB	Review email from opposing counsel regarding new subpoenas; forward to Gableman	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
1/6/2022	MM	Review subpoena statuses	0.60 150.00/hr	90.00
	MM	Research out of state subpoena statuses; take notes	3.80 150.00/hr	570.00
	MM	Review subpoena statutes, take notes	0.50 150.00/hr	75.00
	MM	Outline subpoena research	0.80 150.00/hr	120.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/6/2022	MM	Outline subpoena research	0.60 150.00/hr	90.00
1/7/2022	MM	E-mail James Bopp, Jr. regarding Subpoena research assignment	0.10 150.00/hr	15.00
	MM	Research subpoena statutes	0.20 150.00/hr	30.00
	MM	Review law on out of state subpoenas	0.70 150.00/hr	105.00
	JB	Phone conference with George regarding next steps	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
	JB	E-mail from Michael Massie regarding Subpoena research assignment	0.10 450.00/hr	45.00
	MM	Review case law on out of state subpoenas	1.80 150.00/hr	270.00
1/10/2022	MM	Review law on out of state subpoenas	0.80 150.00/hr	120.00
	MM	Draft memo on out of state subpoena	1.10 150.00/hr	165.00
	MM	Draft memo on out of state subpoena	0.30 150.00/hr	45.00
	MM	Draft memo on out of state subpoenas	0.30 150.00/hr	45.00
	MM	Review order and opinion on motion to dismiss/motion for temporary injunction	1.40 150.00/hr	210.00
	MM	Research statutes and case law on Minnesota subpoena statutes	0.60 150.00/hr	90.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/10/2022	MM	Research statues and case law on Illinois subpoena statutes	0.50 150.00/hr	75.00
	MM	Review statues and case law on New York subpoena statutes	0.40 150.00/hr	60.00
	JB	Phone conference with press regarding decision	0.30 450.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	JB	Review decision	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00
	JB	Phone conference with Courtney E. Milbank regarding next steps	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
	JB	Phone conference with Mike Gableman, Mike Dean and Courtney E. Milbank regarding next steps	0.90 450.00/hr	405.00
	JB	Review email exchange regarding call with co-counsel	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
	CEM	Opinion and Order; review the same; call with James Bopp, Jr. regarding the same	0.80 240.00/hr	192.00
	CEM	E-mail to Gableman regarding Opinion and time to discuss; call to Mike Dean regarding the same	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	E-mails with Joint Counsel regarding time to discuss next steps	0.40 240.00/hr	96.00
	CEM	Two conferences with Mike Dean regarding opinion and next steps	0.50 240.00/hr	120.00
	CEM	Phone conference with client, James Bopp, Jr. and Mike Dean	0.90 240.00/hr	216.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/11/2022	MM	Draft memo on out-of-state subpoenas	0.20 150.00/hr	30.00
	MM	Draft memo on out-of-state subpoenas	0.50 150.00/hr	75.00
	MM	Phone conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding memo on out-of-state subpoenas	0.20 150.00/hr	30.00
	CEM	Review memo on out of state subpoenas	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	Phone conference with Joint Counsel regarding next steps	1.00 240.00/hr	240.00
	CEM	Follow-up call with James Bopp, Jr. regarding next steps	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	JB	Phone conference with Michael Massie regarding memo on out-of-state subpoenas	0.20 450.00/hr	90.00
	JB	Follow-up call with Courtney E. Milbank regarding next steps	0.10 450.00/hr	45.00
1/12/2022	CEM	E-mails with Mike Dean and joint counsels regarding answer and due date	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	CEM	Conference with Mike Dean regarding answer and due date	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	JB	E-mail exchange regarding Answer; phone conference with Courtney E. Milbank regarding Answer	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
1/13/2022	MM	Review memo on out-of state subpoena	0.70 150.00/hr	105.00
	MM	Review statutes on out-of state subpoenas	0.60 150.00/hr	90.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/13/2022	MM	Review case law on out-of state subpoenas	1.00 150.00/hr	150.00
	JB	Phone conference with counsel	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	CEM	Phone conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding Answer	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
1/14/2022	MM	Review case law on legislative subpoena power	0.70 150.00/hr	105.00
	MM	Edit memo on out of state subpoenas	0.50 150.00/hr	75.00
	MM	Edit memo on out of state subpoenas, review state statutes on foreign subpoenas	0.80 150.00/hr	120.00
1/20/2022	JB	Phone conference with client regarding next steps	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00
	MM	Review Motion to Intervene Documents	0.20 150.00/hr	30.00
	MM	Take notes on Motion to Intervene Documents	0.30 150.00/hr	45.00
	JB	Review answer of co-defendants	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
1/21/2022	MM	Review Motion to Intervene Documents	0.70 150.00/hr	105.00
1/22/2022	JB	Review Assembly intervention; appeal; email exchange with Courtney E. Milbank regarding appeal	1.10 450.00/hr	495.00
	CEM	E-mail exchange with James Bopp, Jr. regarding appeal	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/24/2022	MM	Review Motion to Intervene	0.20 150.00/hr	30.00
	MM	Review Wisconsin's Motion to Intervene Statute	0.10 150.00/hr	15.00
	MM	Research case law on motion to intervene	0.10 150.00/hr	15.00
	MM	Review case law on motion to intervene	0.20 150.00/hr	30.00
	MM	Phone conference with Courtney E. Milbank regarding Response to Motion to Intervene	0.10 150.00/hr	15.00
	MM	Review case law on motion to intervene	0.70 150.00/hr	105.00
	MM	Review case law on motion to intervene elements	0.70 150.00/hr	105.00
	MM	Review case law on motion to intervene elements, take notes	1.30 150.00/hr	195.00
	MM	Draft notes and outline for response to motion to intervene	0.70 150.00/hr	105.00
	JB	Review draft answer; email exchange regarding answer	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00
	JB	Review Notice of Joinder by Committee to appeal	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
	JB	E-mail exchange with Mike Dean regarding appeal	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
	CEM	Review multiple filings	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/24/2022	CEM	Phone conference with Michael Massie regarding opposition to intervene	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	Review answer and provide feedback	0.50 240.00/hr	120.00
	CEM	E-mail with Mike regarding motion to intervene due date	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
1/25/2022	MM	Review case law on motion to intervene	0.80 150.00/hr	120.00
	MM	Draft notes on outline for Response to Motion to Intervene	0.40 150.00/hr	60.00
	MM	Draft fact section and outline of argument section for Response to Motion to Intervene	2.00 150.00/hr	300.00
	MM	Phone conference with Courtney E. Milbank regarding Response to Motion to Intervene	0.20 150.00/hr	30.00
	MM	Draft outline of argument section for Response to Motion to Intervene	0.90 150.00/hr	135.00
	MM	Review documents from Mike Dean	1.30 150.00/hr	195.00
	MM	Review case law on permissive intervention	1.10 150.00/hr	165.00
	JB	Review Committee Answers	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00
	JB	E-mail exchange with Mike Dean regarding Motion to Intervene hearing	0.20 450.00/hr	90.00
	JB	Review draft of opposition to Motion to Intervene	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/25/2022	CEM	CM/ECF OSC Answer	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	E-mails with local counsel regarding appeal	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	Petition for Interlocutory appeal; review the same	0.80 240.00/hr	192.00
	CEM	Conferences with client	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	CEM	E-mails with local counsel and James Bopp, Jr. regarding motion to intervene argument	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	Review opposition to motion to intervene outline	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	Phone conference with Michael Massie regarding Response to Motion to Intervene	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	JB	E-mails with local counsel and Courtney E. Milbank regarding motion to intervene argument	0.20 450.00/hr	90.00
1/26/2022	MM	Draft Response to Motion to Intervene, review case law, review outline	1.80 150.00/hr	270.00
	MM	Draft Response to Motion to Intervene, review case law, review outline	2.00 150.00/hr	300.00
1/27/2022	MM	Draft Response to Motion to Intervene	1.60 150.00/hr	240.00
	MM	Draft Response to Motion to Intervene, review case law, review Voces' Motion to Intervene	2.10 150.00/hr	315.00
	MM	Draft Response to Motion to Intervene	1.30 150.00/hr	195.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/27/2022	MM	Review case law on Permissive Intervention	0.70 150.00/hr	105.00
	CEM	CM/ECF NOA Lenz	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	Conference with client	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
1/28/2022	MM	E-mail Courtney E. Milbank regarding Response to Motion to Intervene	0.10 150.00/hr	15.00
	MM	Review case law on permissive intervention, draft response to motion to intervene	0.40 150.00/hr	60.00
	MM	Draft Response to Motion to Intervene	0.50 150.00/hr	75.00
	MM	Phone conference with Courtney E. Milbank regarding Response to Motion to Intervene	0.10 150.00/hr	15.00
	CEM	E-mails with Michael Massie regarding opposition	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	Review writs and provide feedback; call with Mike Dean regarding the same	0.60 240.00/hr	144.00
	JB	Review amended Complaint	0.80 450.00/hr	360.00
	JB	Review proposed writ regarding WEC; email exchange regarding revision	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00
	CEM	Phone conference with Michael Massie regarding Response to Motion to Intervene	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
1/31/2022	JB	Review Assembly opposition to intervention	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00

	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
For professional services rendered	64.70	\$13,755.00
Previous balance		\$69,085.51
Balance due		\$82,840.51

Attorney Summary

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Courtney E. Milbank	9.50	240.00	\$2,280.00
James Bopp, Jr.	10.80	450.00	\$4,860.00
James Bopp, Jr.	0.30	0.00	\$0.00
Michael Massie	44.10	150.00	\$6,615.00

THE BOPP LAW FIRM, PC
ATTORNEYS AT LAW

THE NATIONAL BUILDING
1 South Sixth Street
TERRE HAUTE, INDIANA 47807-3510
Telephone 812/232-2434 Facsimile 812/235-3685
www.bopplaw.com

3/21/22
Reasonable + necessary
m & j

INVOICE
February 22, 2022

Michael Gableman
Special Counsel to the Wisconsin Assembly Committee on
Campaigns and Elections
P O Box 510766
New Berlin, WI 53151

In Reference To: Legal Representation of Special Counsel Mike Gableman in American
Oversight v. Assembly Office of Special Counsel

Professional Services

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/3/2022	MM Look up docket	0.50 150.00/hr	NO CHARGE
1/4/2022	CEM Conference with Mike Dean regarding case status and needs	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM Call and email to Ron Stadler	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	JB Review research for Special Counsel	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/4/2022	JB Phone conference with Steve regarding PRR retainer and defense of case	0.40 450.00/hr	NO CHARGE
1/5/2022	MM Review Wisconsin open records statutes	0.90 150.00/hr	135.00
	MM Review case documents	0.40 150.00/hr	60.00
1/6/2022	CEM E-mail with Steve Fawcett and Ron Stadler	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM E-mails regarding retainer; send executed retainer to James Bopp, Jr. for signature	0.20 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	CEM E-mails with Mike regarding pleadings; download to public	0.30 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	CEM Work on PHVs; send applications to Mike for filing	0.50 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	MM Review open records statute	0.20 150.00/hr	30.00
	JB E-mail exchange with Mike Dean regarding pleading; review pleading	0.60 450.00/hr	270.00
1/7/2022	CEM E-mail exchange with Mike regarding PHV applications for filing	0.20 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	CEM E-mail from James Bopp, Jr. regarding executed retainer, save to public	0.10 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	CEM CM/ECF Motions for PHV James Bopp, Jr. and Courtney E. Milbank	0.10 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	CEM Begin reviewing petition	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/7/2022	JB E-mail exchange regarding Pro hac vice	0.30 450.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	JB E-mail executed retainer to Courtney E. Milbank	0.10 450.00/hr	NO CHARGE
1/10/2022	CD Phone conference with Courtney E. Milbank regarding reviewing petition and exhibits for Gableman (2x)	0.30 175.00/hr	52.50
	CD Review dockets of other public records request cases filed by American Oversight and research complaint response dates; send summary to Courtney E. Milbank	1.70 175.00/hr	297.50
	CD Review petition and exhibits filed by American Oversight	2.80 175.00/hr	490.00
	CEM Conference with Cassandra Dougherty regarding case assignment (2x)	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	CEM Follow-up email to Ron Stadler	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM Conference with Mike Dean and Dave regarding service of petition and deadlines	0.40 240.00/hr	96.00
1/11/2022	CD Phone conference with Courtney E. Milbank regarding drafting statement of facts for Gableman (2x)	0.20 175.00/hr	35.00
	CD Review petition; pull statutes and cases referenced and save to file	1.70 175.00/hr	297.50
	JB E-mail exchange regarding consolidation; review Motion to Consolidate; phone conference with Mike Dean and Courtney E. Milbank regarding consolidation; email exchange with court regarding status conference	1.10 450.00/hr	495.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/11/2022	CEM	Conference with Mike Dean and James Bopp, Jr. regarding motion to consolidate PRR and email from clerk; review emails with clerk regarding the same	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	CEM	E-mail and phone call with Cassandra Dougherty regarding pro hac vice	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	Phone conference with Cassandra Dougherty regarding drafting statement of facts for Gableman (2x)	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CD	E-mail and phone call with Courtney E. Milbank regarding pro hac vice	0.20 175.00/hr	35.00
1/12/2022	CD	Phone conference with Courtney E. Milbank regarding drafting facts for response and creating table of American Oversight requests and responses (3x)	0.40 175.00/hr	70.00
	CD	Review petition and exhibit to create table of American Oversight requests and responses	2.80 175.00/hr	490.00
	CD	Review Petitioner's attorney's affidavit and exhibits to create working exhibit list	1.90 175.00/hr	332.50
	CD	Create Wisconsin State Bar account; submit pro hac vic application	0.40 175.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	CEM	Draft appearances and file	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	CEM	Review petition and exhibits; start researching	2.70 240.00/hr	648.00
	CEM	CM/ECF Notices of Service Change	0.10 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/12/2022	CEM	CM/ECF Order Granting Media Request	0.10 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	CEM	Conference with Cassandra Dougherty regarding motion to consolidate and requests at issue in each case	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	CM/ECF Order granting James Bopp, Jr. appearance	0.10 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	CEM	Phone conference with Cassandra Dougherty regarding drafting facts for response and creating table of American Oversight requests and responses (3x)	0.40 240.00/hr	96.00
	CD	Conference with Courtney E. Milbank regarding motion to consolidate and requests at issue in each case	0.10 175.00/hr	17.50
1/13/2022	CEM	E-mails with joint counsel regarding time to discuss consolidation; send call in information	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	Conference with joint counsel regarding consolidation and briefing schedule	0.40 240.00/hr	96.00
	CEM	Participate in status conference with Court	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	CEM	Call with Ron Stadler regarding strategy and next steps	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	Conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding next steps	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	Conference with Cassandra Dougherty regarding facts	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	Conference with Mike Dean regarding answer	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/13/2022	CEM	Conference with Mike Dean regarding answer joint defense agreement; review email regarding the same; review agreement	0.40 240.00/hr	96.00
	CEM	E-mail from Cassandra Dougherty regarding pro hac vice application; forward to local counsel	0.20 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	CEM	E-mails Ron regarding documents from other PRR cases; download and review	1.40 240.00/hr	336.00
	CEM	Conference with Cassandra Dougherty regarding review of facts	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	CM/ECF pro hac vice	0.10 240.00/hr	NO CHARGE
	CEM	Follow-up call with James Bopp, Jr. and Mike Dean	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CD	Phone conference with Courtney E. Milbank regarding statement of facts for response to American Oversight's petition for writ of mandamus (x2)	0.30 175.00/hr	52.50
	CD	Review and analyze American Oversight's petition for writ of mandamus	1.60 175.00/hr	280.00
	CD	Review email from Courtney E. Milbank to Michael Dean regarding pro hac vice application	0.10 175.00/hr	17.50
	CD	Pull relevant facts from American Oversight's petition for writ of mandamus for statement of facts for response	0.90 175.00/hr	157.50
	CD	Start drafting statement of facts for response	2.20 175.00/hr	385.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/13/2022	JB Attend Status Conference	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	JB Phone conference with Courtney E. Milbank regarding next steps	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	JB E-mail exchange regarding response	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
	JB Review draft of facts	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	JB Follow-up call with Courtney E. Milbank and Mike Dean	0.20 450.00/hr	90.00
	CEM Phone conference with Cassandra Dougherty regarding statement of facts for response to American Oversight's petition for writ of mandamus (x2)	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
1/14/2022	CEM E-mails regarding lack of service	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM CM/ECF multiple filings (PHV filings and denial of motion to consolidate)	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	CEM E-mail to client regarding affidavit of service	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM Conference with Cassandra Dougherty regarding service affidavit; call to Steve Fawcett regarding same	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM Conference with Cassandra Dougherty regarding sending documents to client and confirming accuracy; review email regarding the same	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/14/2022	CEM	Review facts and provide feedback; conference with Cassandra Dougherty regarding the same	1.00 240.00/hr	240.00
	CEM	Computer assisted legal research--Writ of Mandamus	1.00 240.00/hr	240.00
	CD	Phone conference with Courtney E. Milbank regarding service affidavit and documents to client (2x)	0.40 175.00/hr	70.00
	CD	Work on statement of facts for response	1.90 175.00/hr	332.50
	CD	Draft section for response on plenary authority of legislature	2.40 175.00/hr	420.00
	CD	Phone conference with Courtney E. Milbank regarding edits to statement of facts for response	0.70 175.00/hr	122.50
	CD	Review emails between Courtney E. Milbank and client related to affidavit of service	0.10 175.00/hr	17.50
	JB	Review affidavit of service; email exchange with client regarding service	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	JB	Review documents and selection pleading	0.80 450.00/hr	360.00
1/15/2022	CEM	Two conferences with client	1.00 240.00/hr	240.00
1/17/2022	CD	Work on edits discussed with Courtney E. Milbank to statement of facts section	2.20 175.00/hr	385.00
	CD	Work on edits discussed with Courtney E. Milbank to argument section related to legislature's authority	1.80 175.00/hr	315.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/17/2022	CD Phone conference with Courtney E. Milbank related to edits to statement of facts and argument section regarding the legislature's authority	0.10 175.00/hr	17.50
	CD Continue working on edits to statement of facts section	1.40 175.00/hr	245.00
	JB Phone conference with Courtney E. Milbank regarding next step; email exchange regarding extension	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00
	JB Phone conference with Courtney E. Milbank regarding service; email exchange with local counsel regarding revision; phone conference with Courtney E. Milbank regarding proposal; review email exchange regarding proposal	0.80 450.00/hr	360.00
	JB Review revised request and response	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	JB Review JDF; review email exchange opposing it	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	JB Review draft Motion to Quash by Ron	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	CEM Work on Motion to Quash and CALR regarding the same	3.30 240.00/hr	792.00
	CEM Two conferences with James Bopp, Jr. regarding lack of service and continuance	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM Multiple conferences with Mike regarding lack of service and continuance, and motion to quash	0.50 240.00/hr	120.00
	CEM Conference with Cassandra Dougherty regarding Motion to Quash edits to facts	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/17/2022	CEM Work on extension and service issue	0.40 240.00/hr	96.00
	CEM Review email to opposing counsel regarding lack of service and motion to quash	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM Phone conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding next step; email exchange regarding extension	0.50 240.00/hr	120.00
1/18/2022	CD Complete edits to statement of facts and legislature's authority sections	1.10 175.00/hr	192.50
	CD Phone conference with Courtney E. Milbank regarding statement of facts section (3x)	0.30 175.00/hr	52.50
	CD Phone conference with Courtney E. Milbank regarding argument on clear intent of legislature (2x)	0.20 175.00/hr	35.00
	CD Review Gableman contract and enabling documents sent by Clinton Lancaster	0.50 175.00/hr	87.50
	CD Review emails between Courtney E. Milbank and Ron Stadler related to request for extension (2x)	0.20 175.00/hr	35.00
	CD Review law review article on statutory construction in Wisconsin and case <i>Kalal</i>	0.70 175.00/hr	122.50
	CD Draft argument section related to clear intent of legislature for response	2.60 175.00/hr	455.00
	CEM Conference with Cassandra Dougherty regarding facts (3x)	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	CEM E-mail from joint counsel regarding motion to quash; review the same	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/18/2022	CEM	CM/ECF Doc. 76 Order denying motion to consolidate	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM	Work on Motion to Quash and CALR regarding the same	4.20 240.00/hr	1,008.00
	CEM	Review motion to continue; respond	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	CEM	Review emails with opposing counsel	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	E-mails with joint counsel regarding joint defense agreement	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	Multiple conferences with Mike Dean regarding extension	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	CEM	Conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding hearing Friday and response from opposing counsel	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	JB	Conference with Courtney E. Milbank regarding hearing Friday and response from opposing counsel	0.20 450.00/hr	90.00
	CEM	Conference with client	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	CEM	Phone conference with Cassandra Dougherty regarding argument on clear intent of legislature (2x)	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
1/19/2022	JB	Review Court Order; phone conference with Courtney E. Milbank regarding next steps	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
	JB	Review draft of Motion to Quash; two conferences with Courtney E. Milbank regarding revision and service issue	1.30 450.00/hr	585.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/19/2022	CEM E-mail and voicemail from client	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM E-mail from joint counsel regarding JDA	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM Work on Motion to Quash; multiple conferences with Cassandra Dougherty regarding same; conference with client	6.00 240.00/hr	1,440.00
	CEM Two conferences with James Bopp, Jr. regarding motion to quash revision and service issue	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM Conference with local counsel	0.40 240.00/hr	96.00
	CD Phone conference with Courtney E. Milbank regarding motion to quash and section on statutory exemption statement of facts section	0.10 175.00/hr	17.50
	CD Draft section on statutory exemption for motion to quash; send to Courtney E. Milbank	1.80 175.00/hr	315.00
	CD Phone conference with Courtney E. Milbank regarding motion to quash and partisanship of American Oversight (2x)	0.20 175.00/hr	35.00
	CD Review American Oversight website and draft footnote on partisanship of board; send to Courtney E. Milbank	0.50 175.00/hr	87.50
	CD Phone conference with Courtney E. Milbank regarding motion to quash and Wisconsin statute section 19.85 (3x)	0.40 175.00/hr	70.00
	CD Research Wisconsin statute section 19.85; draft corresponding section for motion to quash; send to Courtney E. Milbank	1.50 175.00/hr	262.50

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/19/2022	CD Phone conference with Courtney E. Milbank regarding motion to quash and section on public interest	0.10 175.00/hr	17.50
	CD Research and draft section on public interest outweighing nondisclosure of election investigation information; send to Courtney E. Milbank	1.30 175.00/hr	227.50
	CD Phone conference with Courtney E. Milbank regarding sending motion to quash draft to client and co-counsel for review	0.10 175.00/hr	17.50
	CD Convert motion to quash to PDF; draft corresponding email and send to client and co-counsel for review	0.30 175.00/hr	52.50
	CEM Conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding next steps	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
1/20/2022	JB Review draft of Motion to Dismiss and affidavits	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00
	JB Review email exchange regarding questions	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	JB Phone conference with Courtney E. Milbank and Mike Dean argument regarding pleading and hearing	0.70 450.00/hr	315.00
	CEM Conference with James Bopp, Jr. and local counsel regarding potential arguments	0.70 240.00/hr	168.00
	CEM Call with client	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM E-mails with Mike Dean regarding motion to quash	0.40 240.00/hr	96.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/20/2022	CEM CM/ECF Letter to Appear Remotely	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM E-mails with joint counsel regarding appeal	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM Multiple conferences with Mike Dean regarding motion and hearing	0.40 240.00/hr	96.00
	CEM Conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding hearing	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM Finalize Motion to Quash	1.00 240.00/hr	240.00
	CEM Conference with Cassandra Dougherty regarding oral argument folder	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CD Research issue of whether a failure to raise the issue of a specific denial waives that right for motion to quash	1.70 175.00/hr	297.50
	CD Research issue of what triggers an in camera review for motion to quash	1.20 175.00/hr	210.00
	CD Phone conference with Courtney E. Milbank regarding final review of motion to quash (3x)	0.30 175.00/hr	52.50
	CD Conduct final review of motion to quash; research correct citations	2.20 175.00/hr	385.00
	CD Research and save docket documents, statutes, and case law to oral argument folder	0.80 175.00/hr	140.00
	JB Review Mike Dean draft of Motion to Dismiss and Gableman affidavit; phone conference with Courtney E. Milbank and Mike Dean regarding Motion and affidavit	1.10 450.00/hr	495.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/20/2022	JB Review email from Mike Dean regarding legal issues	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	JB Review revision of affidavit; review email from Mike Dean regarding legal issues	0.70 450.00/hr	315.00
	JB Review email from Mike Gableman regarding legal issues	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
	JB Review revision of Motion and brief; review email exchange regarding revision	0.90 450.00/hr	405.00
	JB Review draft of "research" section	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
	JB Review revision of affidavit and email	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	JB Review Assembly Response	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00
	JB Conference with Courtney E. Milbank regarding hearing	0.10 450.00/hr	45.00
	CD Conference with Courtney E. Milbank regarding oral argument folder	0.20 175.00/hr	35.00
	CEM Phone conference with Cassandra Dougherty regarding final review of motion to quash (3x)	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	CEM Conference with James Bopp, Jr. and Mike Dean regarding motion and affidavit	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
1/21/2022	CEM Participate in hearing	2.00 240.00/hr	480.00
	CD Attend Videoconference Hearing on motion to quash	2.00 175.00/hr	350.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/21/2022	JB Review Court Order	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
	JB Study Assembly Response	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00
	JB Preparation for Oral Argument	2.30 450.00/hr	1,035.00
	JB Review materials for Oral Argument	0.80 450.00/hr	360.00
	JB Attend Hearing	2.00 450.00/hr	900.00
	JB Phone conference with Courtney E. Milbank regarding next steps	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
	JB E-mail exchange regarding meeting	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
	JB Phone conference with client regarding next steps	1.00 450.00/hr	450.00
	CEM Phone conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding next steps	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
1/22/2022	CEM Conference with client	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM Conference with James Bopp, Jr., Mike Dean, and client	1.00 240.00/hr	240.00
	CEM Calls with client	0.40 240.00/hr	96.00
	JB Phone conference with client, Mike Dean and Courtney E. Milbank regarding next steps	1.00 450.00/hr	450.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/22/2022	JB Phone conference with client regarding next steps and hearing	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00
	JB Review Mike Dean to-do-list for conference call	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
1/24/2022	CD Phone conference with Courtney E. Milbank regarding reviewing requests for summary for document production to send to client	0.20 175.00/hr	35.00
	CD Summarize requests from American Oversight for client; work on corresponding memorandum	2.30 175.00/hr	402.50
	CD Complete memorandum on summary of requested document production for client	1.70 175.00/hr	297.50
	CD Review memorandum of summary of document production for client; send to client and associate	0.40 175.00/hr	70.00
	JB Review agreement addendum; phone conference with Courtney E. Milbank regarding production of addendum to court	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	JB E-mail exchange regarding production of addendum	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
	JB E-mail exchange regarding production of addendum	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
	JB Review email exchange regarding Assembly draft ballot; phone conference with Courtney E. Milbank regarding revision	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00
	JB Review draft document request for Plaintiff's	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	CEM Decision and Order striking legislature motion	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/24/2022	CEM	Multiple filings; review the same	0.50 240.00/hr	120.00
	CEM	Review addendum, email to James Bopp, Jr. regarding the same; conference with OSC regarding the same; file	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	CEM	Conference with Cassandra Dougherty regarding document production	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	Phone call from James Bopp, Jr. regarding agreement from Gableman, emails with Mike Gableman regarding the same	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	CEM	Multiple conferences with local counsel	0.40 240.00/hr	96.00
	CEM	Multiple conferences with client	1.20 240.00/hr	288.00
	CEM	Review and edit Committee motion; conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding the same	0.50 240.00/hr	120.00
	CEM	Work with Cassandra Dougherty on Advisory Opinion summary	0.40 240.00/hr	96.00
	CD	Work with Courtney E. Milbank on Advisory Opinion summary	0.40 175.00/hr	70.00
1/25/2022	CD	Review video of Motion to Quash hearing for Petitioner's reference to legislative exception	0.40 175.00/hr	70.00
	CD	Phone conference with Courtney E. Milbank regarding duty to retain	0.20 175.00/hr	35.00
	CD	Review correspondence from Steve Fawcett related to Legislative Council memo	0.20 175.00/hr	35.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/25/2022	CD Conduct search for Legislative Council memo referenced by Petitioner in hearing on Motion to Quash	0.80 175.00/hr	140.00
	CD Review Wisconsin Attorney General guide for public record requests; review cited cases	2.20 175.00/hr	385.00
	JB Review Court Order	0.20 450.00/hr	90.00
	JB Phone conference with client regarding next steps	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00
	CEM CM/ECF First Amended Agreement	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM CM/ECF Committee Answer	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM E-mail regarding records requested	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM CM/ECF Proposed Scheduling Order	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM E-mails with local counsel regarding hearing	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM Conference with Cassandra Dougherty regarding duty to retain	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM E-mails regarding legislative counsel memo	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
1/26/2022	CD Phone conference with Courtney E. Milbank regarding approach for responding to public record requests (4x)	0.40 175.00/hr	70.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/26/2022	CD Work on client memorandum on four-step approach for responding to public record requests; make edits per Courtney E. Milbank's review	1.60 175.00/hr	280.00
	CD Work on client memorandum on four-step approach for responding to public record requests; research remedy if requested records are destroyed	1.80 175.00/hr	315.00
	CD Review draft of Motion to Reconsider	0.70 175.00/hr	122.50
	CD Review case law on statutory exemption (<i>Journal Times v. City of Racine Bd.</i>)	0.60 175.00/hr	105.00
	CD Send client memorandum on approach for responding to public record requests to Courtney E. Milbank for final review	0.40 175.00/hr	70.00
	CEM E-mails regarding service	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM CM/ECF Scheduling order	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM Conference with client	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM Conference with local counsel	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM Review Wisconsin Statute 12.13(5) and prepare motion for reconsideration; emails with the other attorneys regarding the same	3.70 240.00/hr	888.00
	CEM Conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding motion to reconsider	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/26/2022	CEM	Conferences with Cassandra Dougherty regarding summary of laws for responding to public records requests	0.40 240.00/hr	96.00
	CEM	Review Cassandra Dougherty's summary of public records law for client; conferences with Cassandra Dougherty regarding the same	0.50 240.00/hr	120.00
	JB	Review amended Motion to Quash by Assembly and case	0.90 450.00/hr	405.00
	JB	E-mail exchange regarding hearing; review proposed letter to court	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
	JB	Phone conference with Courtney E. Milbank regarding hearing and production	0.30 450.00/hr	135.00
	JB	E-mail exchange regarding waiver service; review letter to court	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00
	JB	E-mail exchange regarding liability for filing documents; Motion to Reconsider	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	JB	Review draft Motion to Reconsider; email exchange regarding draft	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00
	JB	Review Cassandra Dougherty memo regarding retainer documents	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	JB	Conference with Courtney E. Milbank regarding motion to reconsider	0.10 450.00/hr	45.00
	CEM	Phone conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding hearing and production	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
1/27/2022	CD	Phone conferences with Courtney E. Milbank regarding edits to memorandum on approach for responding to public record requests (2x)	0.20 175.00/hr	35.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/27/2022	CD Finalize and send client memorandum on approach for responding to public record requests to Mike Gableman	0.70 175.00/hr	122.50
	CEM Call with local counsel regarding motion to reconsider	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM CM/ECF multiple filings (media request, notices of hearing, acceptance of service)	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	CEM Multiple emails with other attorneys regarding Motion to Reconsider; finalize the same; multiple calls with local counsel regarding the same	1.50 240.00/hr	360.00
	CEM Conference with James Bopp, Jr. regarding motion to reconsider	0.10 240.00/hr	24.00
	CEM E-mail from Cassandra Dougherty regarding summary of record retention and 4 step process; review the same; make edits	0.40 240.00/hr	96.00
	CEM Conference with client regarding document production	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM Conference with local counsel regarding document production	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	JB E-mail exchange regarding Motion to Reconsider; phone conference with Courtney E. Milbank regarding issues in Motion to Reconsider	0.50 450.00/hr	225.00
	JB Review revision of retainer memo	0.40 450.00/hr	180.00
	CEM Phone conferences with Cassandra Dougherty regarding edits to memorandum on approach for responding to public record requests (2x)	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00

			<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/28/2022	CD	Phone conference with Courtney E. Milbank regarding document production (2x)	0.20 175.00/hr	35.00
	CD	E-mail James Bopp, Jr. regarding client memorandum; forward email to client	0.20 175.00/hr	35.00
	CD	Call and leave voicemails with Mike Dean regarding document production (2x)	0.20 175.00/hr	35.00
	CD	Phone conference with Mike Dean regarding document production	0.10 175.00/hr	17.50
	CD	Review documents shared by Mike Dean from Mike Gableman	2.70 175.00/hr	472.50
	CEM	E-mails regarding document production	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	Conference with local counsel regarding document production	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	Conferences with Cassandra Dougherty regarding helping counsel with document production (2x)	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	Order denying Motion for Reconsideration	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	Opposition to Motion for Reconsideration	0.20 240.00/hr	48.00
	CEM	E-mails regarding denial of motion for reconsideration and document production	0.30 240.00/hr	72.00
	JB	Review court order; email exchange regarding no appeal	0.60 450.00/hr	270.00

		<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/29/2022	CD	Videoconference with Mike Dean, Mike Gableman, Ron Stadler, Courtney E. Milbank, and others regarding document production	0.90 175.00/hr 157.50
	CD	Continue review of documents from Mike Gableman	1.80 175.00/hr 315.00
	CEM	Conference with client and attorneys regarding document production	0.90 240.00/hr 216.00
	JB	Review email exchange regarding document production	0.50 450.00/hr 225.00
	JB	Phone conference with client, Courtney E. Milbank and Mike Dean regarding document production	0.50 450.00/hr 225.00
	JB	E-mail exchange regarding document production	0.30 450.00/hr 135.00
1/31/2022	CD	Review correspondence from Mike Dean related to document production	0.10 175.00/hr 17.50
	CEM	Multiple emails regarding document production and motion to stay	0.40 240.00/hr 96.00
	CEM	Multiple calls with local counsel regarding production of documents	0.70 240.00/hr 168.00
	CEM	Computer assisted legal research public records	1.00 240.00/hr 240.00
	JB	Review court order; email co-counsel regarding Motion to Stay	0.30 450.00/hr 135.00
		<hr/>	<hr/>
For professional services rendered		167.40	\$41,749.50

Additional charges:

	<u>Qty/Price</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/6/2022 Cost advanced for pro hac vice admission for Courtney E. Milbank--payable to State Bar of Wisconsin--paid online--service@wisbar.org---paid on 01-06-22--Transaction # AG1E5B7B57FD--MC	1 \$250.00	250.00
Cost advanced for pro hac vice admission for James Bopp, Jr.--payable to State Bar of Wisconsin--paid online--service@wisbar.org---paid on 01-06-22--Transaction # AA1E5B7A8400--MC	1 \$250.00	250.00
1/12/2022 Cost advanced for PHV Fee for Cassandra Dougherty--paid online on 01-12-2022--paid to State Bar of Wisconsin--Transaction # AN1E4B3B6F93--MC	1 \$250.00	250.00
1/13/2022 Cost advanced for WestLaw computer assisted legal research--Writ of Mandamus and Public Records	20 \$3.00	60.00
1/14/2022 Cost advanced for WestLaw computer assisted legal research--Writ of Mandamus and Public Records	20 \$3.00	60.00
1/18/2022 Cost advanced for WestLaw computer assisted legal research--research Motion to Quash	45 \$3.00	135.00
1/19/2022 Cost advanced for WestLaw computer assisted legal research--research Motion to Quash	70 \$3.00	210.00
1/20/2022 Cost advanced for WestLaw computer assisted legal research--research failure to raise issue of specific denial	102 \$3.00	306.00
Cost advanced for WestLaw computer assisted legal research--research issue of what triggers in camera review	72 \$3.00	216.00
1/21/2022 Cost advanced for WestLaw computer assisted legal research--research cases mentioned by Judge	10 \$3.00	30.00

	<u>Qty/Price</u>	<u>Amount</u>
1/25/2022 Cost advanced for WestLaw computer assisted legal research--research cases in Attorney General Memo on responding to public records requests	45 \$3.00	135.00
1/26/2022 Cost advanced for WestLaw computer assisted legal research--research Motion to Reconsider	35 \$3.00	105.00
Cost advanced for WestLaw computer assisted legal research--review remedy where requested records are destroyed	48 \$3.00	144.00
Total costs		<u>\$2,151.00</u>
Total amount of this bill		<u>\$43,900.50</u>
Previous balance		\$999.00
Balance due		<u><u>\$44,899.50</u></u>

Attorney Summary

<u>Name</u>	<u>Hrs/Rate</u>	<u>Rate</u>	<u>Amount</u>
Cassandra Dougherty	69.90	175.00	\$12,232.50
Cassandra Dougherty	0.40	0.00	\$0.00
Courtney E. Milbank	58.30	240.00	\$13,992.00
Courtney E. Milbank	2.00	0.00	\$0.00
James Bopp, Jr.	34.00	450.00	\$15,300.00
James Bopp, Jr.	0.80	0.00	\$0.00
Michael Massie	1.50	150.00	\$225.00
Michael Massie	0.50	0.00	\$0.00